

P.C. Simonton & Associates, Inc.
 Consulting Engineers
 Hinesville and Greensboro, GA



Tank Raising & Well Improvements, Contract B
 For City of Hinesville
 PCS No. 2014-41

I CERTIFY THAT THIS TABULATION IS A
 TRUE REPRESENTATION OF THE BIDS
 RECEIVED ON OCTOBER 24, 2017.

Item No.	Est. Quantity	Units	Description	Tank Pro, Inc. Northport, AL		Phoenix Fabricators & Erectors, LLC Avon, IN		R.E. McLean Tank, Co. Gastonia, NC		Pittsburg Tank & Tower Maintenance Co., Inc. Henderson, KY	
				Price if Awarded Separately	Price if Awarded Collectively	Price if Awarded Separately	Price if Awarded Collectively	Price if Awarded Separately	Price if Awarded Collectively	Price if Awarded Separately	Price if Awarded Collectively
A.	1	LS	Shaw Road Tank	\$369,012.00	\$369,012.00	\$391,500.00	\$390,700.00	\$494,000.00	No Bid	\$665,464.00	\$632,190.00
B.	1	LS	General Stewart Way Tank	\$514,294.00	\$447,093.00	\$707,200.00	\$681,200.00	\$548,000.00	No Bid	\$848,855.00	\$806,412.00
C.	1	LS	S.R. 196/Cypress Bend Tank	\$484,214.00	\$441,635.00	\$376,800.00	\$376,300.00	\$480,000.00	No Bid	\$684,689.00	\$650,454.00
			Total		\$1,257,740.00*		\$1,448,200.00		No bid		\$2,089,056.00

*Mathematical Error in Original Bid